

**BID TABULATION**

Project: 2017 Roof Replacements, Orange County Schools  
 REI Project No.: 017RAL-028

Time: 1:00 p.m., May 25, 2017  
 Location: 200 E. King St., Hillsborough, NC

Contractor	License Number	Base Bids			Alternates						Addendum No. 1	Attachments					
		No. 1	No. 2	No. 3	No. 1	No. 2	No. 3	No. 4	No. 5	No. 6		Bid Bond	EMR Doc.	Travel Time	Inst. Cert.	Mfgr. Ack.	MBE Docs.
Baker Roofing Company 517 Mercury St. Raleigh, NC 27603 Bid Rec'd 5/25/17, 12:47 pm	5812	\$261,533.00	\$ 69,176.00	NO BID	-\$12,000.00	-\$3,500.00 SEE NOTE 1	NO BID	\$2,100.00	NO BID	NO BID	X	X	X	X	X	X	X
Owens Roofing Company 301 W. Cabarrus St. Raleigh, NC 27545 Bid Rec'd 5/25/17, 12:49 pm	24442	\$282,544.00	\$ 77,215.00	\$508,040.00	-\$15,430.00	-\$3,500.00	-\$12,900.00	\$5,200.00	\$46,640.00	-\$9,200.00	X	X	X	X	X	X	X
Hamlin Roofing Company 1411 West Garner Road Garner, NC Bid Rec'd 5/25/17, 12:13 pm	5855	\$321,500.00	\$104,500.00	NO BID	-\$11,000.00	-\$9,000.00	NO BID	\$2,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	X	X	X		X	X	X
Ethridge Roofing, Inc. 1211 Tarboro St. SW Wilson, NC 27893 Bid Rec'd 5/25/17, 11:50 am	75759	\$390,425.00	\$ 97,491.00	NO BID	-\$60,064.00	\$5,868.00 SEE NOTE 2	NO BID	\$3,082 SEE NOTE 3	NO BID	NO BID	X	X	X	X	X	X	X


Base Bids: No. 1: AL Stanback MS  
 No. 2: Central ES  
 No. 3: Grady Brown ES

X = Received with bid

Alternates: No. 1: TPO at Stanback MS  
 No. 2: TPO at Central ES  
 No. 3: TPO at Grady Brown ES  
 No. 4: Sealant work at Stanback MS  
 No. 5: Replace wood framing with steel framing at Grady Brown ES  
 No. 6: Metal fascia/soffit at Grady Brown ES

Note 1: Words state a cost of \$(3,500.00). Figures state a cost of \$(3,000.00).  
 Note 2: Add or deduct was not specified.  
 Note 3: Words state a cost of \$3,082.00. Figures state a cost of \$3,682.00. Add or deduct was not specified.

I certify that this is a correct tabulation of all bids received for this Project on the date stated above.

  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 Kenneth Tyner, PE, RRC  
 REI Engineers, Inc.

5/26/2017  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 Date